AVERAGE SUCCESSFUL BIDS - As of May 5, 2022
Clark County Forest

Species/Type Volume Weighted Average High Low
tons cords per ton | per cord per ton | per cord | perton | per cord
Aspen Pulp 6350 2822 $7.61 $17.12 $13.00 $29.25 $4.50 $10.13
Aspen Bolts 650 289 $20.47 | $46.07 $32.80 $73.80 $8.00 $18.00
Oak Pulp 10500 3818 $7.65 $21.03 $18.00 $49.50 $4.00 $11.00
Oak Bolts 4440 1615 $24.50 | $67.37 $47.10 | $129.53 $8.00 $22.00
Mixed Hardwood Pulp 5285 2298 $7.05 $16.23 $18.00 $41.40 $2.30 $5.29
Tamarack 110 47 $13.00 | $26.00 $13.00 $26.00 $13.00 $26.00
Basswood Pulp 0 0 #DIV/O! | #DIV/O! $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Mixed Hardwood Bolts 198 86 $19.34 $44.48 $30.00 $69.00 $14.55 $33.47
Jack Pine Pulp 180 85 $13.00 | $27.69 $13.00 $27.69 $13.00 $27.69
Red Pine Pulp 860 382 $8.17 $18.37 $11.50 $25.88 $6.02 $13.55
White Pine Pulp 2710 1290 $8.02 $16.85 $10.00 $21.00 $5.25 $11.03
*Red Pine Comingled 7820 3476 $49.66 | $111.73 $66.37 | $149.33 $6.00 $13.50
*White Pine Comingled 3585 1707 $23.12 $48.55 $45.96 $96.52 $8.00 $16.80
mbf mbf mbf mbf
Red Oak Sawlog 1206 $475.12 $575.00 $285.00
White Oak Sawlog 299 $599.07 $779.00 $285.00
Black Oak Sawlog 21 $221.43 $300.00 $120.00
Red Maple Sawlog 32 $352.81 $420.00 $300.00
Sugar Maple Sawlog 0 #DIV/0! $0.00 $0.00
Mixed Hardwood Sawlog 59 $318.14 $460.00 $160.00
Red Pine Sawlogs 0 #DIV/O! $0.00 $0.00
White Pine Sawlogs 41 $157.32 $200.00 $150.00

*Includes Pine Bolts Sold




TIMBER SALE BID RESULTS

CLARK COUNTY FOREST

June 9, 2022

Tract Number of Bids
Number Qualified Non-Qualified High Bidder Appraised Value Bid Value
30-19 0 0 No Bid $4,847.20 $ -
39-19 0 0 No Bid $4,748.20 $ =
45-19 1 0 Nicholas Syryczuk $5,915.00 $ 5,925.00
48-19 1 0 Nicholas Syryczuk $2,504.80 $ 2,508.20
15-20 0 0 No Bid $6,652.00 $ -
20-20 0 0 No Bid $8,921.00 $ =
35-20 0 0 No Bid $13,170.00 $ -
41-20 0 0 No Bid $1,740.00 $ =
49-20 1 0 Schreiner Forestry $5,480.00 $ 8,600.00
14-21 1 0 Flannel Fleet Logging $29,312.00 $ 29,452.50
19-21 1 0 Flannel Fleet Logging $16,505.00 $ 16,770.00
20-21 0 0 No Bid $10,739.70 $ =
24-21 0 0 No Bid $4,546.00 $ -
29-21 1 0 Ryder Logging $15,087.20 $ 15,500.00
40-21 2 0 Biewer Sawmill $45,374.40 $ 87,016.10
1-22 10 0 Northwest Hardwoods $91,211.90 $ 165,030.00
2-22 6 0 Northwest Hardwoods $129,713.60 $ 187,570.00
3-22 9 0 Bridge Creek Logging $19,878.80 $ 33,832.00
4-22 7 0 Northwest Hardwoods $49,983.00 $ 72,300.00
5-22 3 0 Flannel Fleet Logging $42,506.20 $ 51,379.50
6-22 5 0 Martin's Forestry LLC $19,705.40 $ 29,748.00
7-22 4 0 Flannel Fleet Logging $29,434.00 $ 36,674.40
8-22 2 0 Ryder Logging $17,891.20 $ 18,875.00
9-22 4 0 Wiitala & Vozka Logging $24,420.00 $ 39,280.00
10-22 6 0 Ule Logging $12,508.00 $ 18,520.00
11-22 8 0 Tigerton Lumber $71,244.40 $ 115,120.00
12-22 3 0 Weyer Logging LLC $19,272.60 $ 23,490.00
13-22 6 0 Wiitala & Vozka Logging $38,410.00 $ 65,466.00
14-22 3 0 Flannel Fleet Logging $30,248.60 $ 50,300.00
15-22 9 0 Northwest Hardwoods $30,620.40 $ 48,780.00
16-22 2 0 Ryder Logging $23,603.80 $ 27,115.00
17-22 2 0 Solberg Trucking LLC $5,064.80 $ 7,300.00
18-22 1 0 Ryder Logging $19,089.00 $ 22,687.50
19-22 8 0 Northwest Hardwoods $102,700.90 $ 186,792.00
20-22 7 0 Stella-Jones Corporation $98,006.00 $ 212,046.60
21-22 1 0 Flannel Fleet Logging $23,976.60 $ 26,920.00
Totals 114 0 $1,075,031.70 [ $ 1,604,997.80
*lump sum
June Bid Opening
Direct Sale
Unsold

Number of Tracts Offered

36| [Total Appraised Value of Tracts Sold

$1,019,667.60

Number of Tracts Receiving Bids 28| |Total Bid Value of Tracts Sold $ 1,604,997.80

Number of Tracts with Qualifying Bids 28| |Percent Increase Over Appraised Value 57%

Number of Tracts with No Bids 8

Total Number of Bids 114| |Cord Equivalent Volume Sold 22,108.00

Total Number of Qualifying Bids 114| |[Average Cord Equivalent/Sold Tract 790

Avg. Number of Qualifying Bids Per Tract 4.1] |Average $ per Cord Equivalent Sold $ 72.60
Acres Sold 1,517.00
Average Acreage of Sold Tracts 54
Average $ per Acre Sold $ 1,058.01




Timber Sale Tracts #30-19, #39-19, #15-20, #20-20,
#35-20, #41-20, #20-21, and #24-21 did not sell on
the June 9, 2022 Clark County Forest timber sale bid
opening. These tracts are available for direct
purchase at 10% above minimum bid value unless
otherwise agreed upon by the Forestry and Parks
Department as per department policy.

Timber Sale Tracts #84-22, #85-22, #86-22, and
#87-22 are storm damaged timber sales resulting
from the December 2022 tornado event. These
tracts are available for direct purchase at the bid
value state on each prospectus page. All salvage
sales will expire on May 1, 2023 and are available
first come, first serve.

Contact the Clark County Forestry Department for
more information. Thank you.

J:\Forestry\OUR Doc's\PROGRAM 1 FORESTRY\Bid Openings\2022 Spring\Timber sale tracts still available 2022S_Direct.doc



Nicholas Syryczuk #1059
Vol  Value
20T-MX 270 4.000
20T-00 90 4.000
16T-AB 60 26.000
20T-A 650 4.500
Bid Total:

FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 Eggf[%’goc'ﬂo'fm
715-743-5140 °
Bid Comparison Report
Tract; 45-19 Minimum Bid: 5,91 5.00
Nicholas Syryczuk #1059 5,925.00
Inc[]
1,080.00
360.00
1,560.00
2,925.00
5,925.00

5/10/2022 3:18:24 PM
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Vol  Value
20T-PR 410 6.020

20T-MX 10  4.000
Bid Total:

Nicholas Syryczuk #1 059

FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

Inc[ ]

2,468.20
40.00
2,508.20

5/10/2022 3:20:20 PM

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

Tract: 48-19
Nicholas Syryczuk #1059

Minimum Bid:

2,504.80

SCS-FMICOC-00083G
FSC 100%

2,508.20

Page 1 of 1



FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

Schreiner Forestry #1030 Inc[]
Vol  Value

10-PW 34 150.000 5,100.00

J20T-F’W 210 10.000 2,100.00

iZOT-MX 95 10.000 950.00

|20T-00 45 10.000 450.00

Bid Total: 8,600.00

5/10/2022 3:21:11 PM

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

Tract: 49-20
Schreiner Forestry #1030

Minimum Bid:

5,480.00

SCS-FM/ICOC-00083G
FSC 100%

8,600.00

Page 1 of 1



FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[ ]

15T-PW
20T-PW
20T-MX
15T-OB

20T-00
15T-AB

20T-A

Vol  Value
760 9.350
490 9.350
460  9.350

60 9.350
180 9.350
70 9.350
1130 9.350
Bid Total:

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 SCS-FINCOC-000836
715-743-5140 FSC 100%
Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 14-21 Minimum Bid:  29,312.00
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 29,452.50
7,106.00
4,581.50
4,301.00
561.00
1,683.00
654.50
10,565.50
29,452.50

5/10/2022 3:21:50 PM
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 ggg-mfgoc-ooosae
715-743-5140 s
Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 19-21 Minimum Bid:  16,505.00
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 16,770.00
[Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[ |
Vol  Value
18T-PR 310 13.000 4,030.00
18T-PW 510 13.000  6,630.00
20T-PJ 180 13.000  2,340.00
20T-T 110 13.000  1,430.00
20T-MX 120 13.000 1,560.00
20T-00 20 13.000 260.00
20T-A 40 13.000 520.00
Bid Total: 16,770.00

5/10/2022 3:22:13 PM

Page 1 of 1



15T-PW
158T-PR
20T-PW
20T-PR
15T-HB
20T-MX

Biewer WI Sawmill #1014

Vol  Value
1045 45.960

490 50.210
1150  8.000
290 11.500
30 20.000
250 5.000
Bid Total:

FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

~Inc[]

48,028.20
24,602.90
9,200.00
3,335.00
600.00
1,250.00
87,016.10

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 S ELC-000536
715-743-5140 Fel 100k
Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 40-21 Minimum Bid:  45,374.40
Biewer WI Sawmill #1014 87,016.10
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 46,383.75 L
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[ |
Vol Value |
16T-PW 1045 14250 14,891.25 |
15T-PR 490 14.250 6,982.50
20T-PW 1150 14.250 16,387.50
20T-PR 290 14.250 4,132.50
15T-HB 30 14.250 427.50
20T-MX 250 14.250 3,562.50
Bid Total:  46,383.75

5/10/2022 3:22:36 PM

Page 1 of 1



FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report
91,211.90

Tract: 1-22

Northwest Hardwoods #1027

Minimum Bid:

FSC 100%

165,030.00

SCS-FM/ICOC-00083G

5/10/2022 3:23:03 PM

Theodore Strzok Log. #1033 126,580.00 L
Aaron Hoover 121,110.00 LJ
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 119,005.40 L
Central WI Lumber #1810 115,434.00 [
Country Forest Prod #1016 109,600.00 [
Ryder Logging #1061 108,760.00 [J
Byers Forestry #1120 107,700.00 LI
Yoder Logging #1357 99,390.00 L
) Schreiner Forestry #1030 ) 98,730.00 LI -
Schreiner Forestry #1030 Inc []|[Yoder Logging #1357 Inc [_]||Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc [_]||[Country Forest Prod #1016 Inc [ ]| Central WI Lumber #1810 Inc[]
Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-PW 2 150.000 300.00 |[10-PW 2 130.000 260.00 |10-PW 2 140.000 280.00 |[10-PW 2 400.000 800.00 | 10-PW 2 125.000 250.00
10-MX 6 200.000 1,200.00 ||10-MX 6 325.000 1,950.00 ||10-MX 6 350.000 2,100.00 |/10-MX 6 400.000 2,400.00 ||10-MX 6 250.000 1,500.00
10-OW 41 400.000 16,400.00 ||10-OW 41 350.000 14,350.00 |[10-OW 41 450.000 18,450.00 ||10-OW 41 400.000 16,400.00 |/10-OW 41 450.000 18,450.00
10-OR 181 350.000 63,350.00 |{10-OR 181 350.000 63,350.00 [|10-OR 181 450.000 81,450.00 ||10-OR 181 400.000 72,400.00 ||10-OR 181 450.000 81,450.00
20T-MX 80 9.000 720.00 ||20T-MX 80 8.000 640.00 ||20T-MX 80 7.180 574.40 ||20T-MX 80 10.000 800.00 [|20T-MX 80 5.450 436.00
15T-OB 540 10.000 5,400.00 |[|[15T-OB 540 18.000 9,720.00 |[15T-OB 540 14.550 7,857.00 ||[15T-OB 540 10.000 5,400.00 [|15T-OB 540 13.450 7,263.00
20T-00 1100 10.000 11,000.00 | 20T-O0O 1100 8.000 8,800.00 ||20T-O0 1100 7.180 7,898.00 |20T-OC 1100 10.000 11,000.00 |[|20T-O0 1100 5.450 5,995.00
20T-A 40 9.000 360.00 |{20T-A 40  8.000 320.00 |20T—I:\ 40 9.900 396.00 ||20T-A 40 10.000 400.00 |/20T-A 40 2250 90.00
Bid Total: 98,730.00 Bid Total: 99,390.00 || Bid Total: 119,005.40 Bid Total: 109,600.00 Bid Total: 115,434.00
Byers Forestry #1120 Inc[ ] Theodore Strzok Log. #1033  Inc[ ]| Northwest Hardwoods #1027  Inc [_|||{Aaron Hoover Inc [_]||Ryder Logging #1061 Inc[ ]
Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-PW 2 150.000 300.00 ||10-PW 2 120.000 240.00 |10-PW 2 200.000 400.00 |[10-PW 2 473.000 946.00 | 10-PW 2 120.000 240.00
10-MX 6 375.000 2,250.00 ||10-MX 6 300.000 1,800.00 ||10-MX 6 450.000 2,700.00 |[10-MX 6 473.000 2,838.00 ||10-MX 6 300.000 1,800.00
10-OW 41 375.000 15,375.00 || 10-OW 41 450.000 18,450.00 ||10-OW 41 775.000 31,775.00 ||[10-OW 41 473.000 19,393.00 | 10-OW 41 465.000 19,065.00
10-OR 181 375.000 67,875.00 ||10-OR 181 450.000 81,450.00 ||10-OR 181 575.000 104,075.00 {|10-OR 181 473.000 85,613.00 ||10-OR 181 395.000 71,495.00
20T-MX 80 6.000 480.00 |20T-MX 80 14.000 1,120.00 | 20T-MX 80 15.000 1,200.00 ||20T-MX 80 7.000 560.00 (|20T-MX 80 5.500 440.00
15T-OB 540 27.000 14,580.00 ||15T-OB 540 14.000 7,660.00 ||156T-OB 540 15.000 8,100.00 |[15T-OB 540 7.000 3,780.00 ||15T-OB 540 17.500 9,450.00
20T-00 1100 6.000 6,600.00 || 20T-OO 1100 14.000 15,400.00 ||20T-O0O 1100 15.000 16,500.00 ||20T-OO 1100 7.000 7,700.00 [|20T-O0 1100 5.500 6,050.00
20T-A 40 6.000 240.00 | 20T-A 40 14.000 560.00 ||20T-A 40 7.000 280.00 ||20T-A 40 7.000 280.00 ||20T-A 40 5,500 220.00
Bid Total: 107,700.00 Bid Total: 126,580.00 Bid Total: 165,030.00 Bid Total: 121,110.00 | ~ Bid Total: 108,760.00

Page 1 of 1




FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN
715-743-5140

54456

Bid Comparison Report
Minimum Bid: 129,713.60

Tract:

2-22
Northwest Hardwoods #1027

Theodore Strzok Log. #1033
Country Forest Prod #1016

Flannel Fleet Logging #1744
Buffalo Lumber & Tie #1015

B Yoder Logging #1357 7
[Buffalo Lumber & Tie #1015 Inc[_||[Yoder Logging #1357 Inc [_]|[Northwest Hardwoods #1027  Inc ]
Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value

10-MR 16 300.000 4,800.00 ||{10-MR 16 300.000 4,800.00 ||{10-MR 16 375.000 6,000.00
10-OW 105 248.000 26,040.00 ||10-OW 105 300.000 31,500.00 |/10-OW 105 550.000 57,750.00
10-OR 216 270.000 58,320.00 ||10-OR 216 275.000 59,400.00 |[10-OR 216 375.000 81,000.00
18T-PR 30 54.350 1,630.50 ||18T-PR 30 16.000 480.00 |18T-PR 30 6.000 180.00
20T-MX 690 7.390 5,099.10 | 20T-MX 690 8.000 5,520.00 20T-MX 690  6.000 4,140.00
15T-OB 980 28.260 27,694.80 ||15T-OB 980 18.000 17,640.00 ! 15T-OB 980 26.000 25,480.00
20T-00 2080 7.390 15,371.20 |20T-O0 2080 8.000 16,640.00 : 20T-O0 2080 6.000 12,480.00
20T-A 90 7.390 665.10 ||20T-A 90 8.000 720.00 | 20T-A 90 6.000 540.00

Bid Total: 139,620.70 Bid Total: 136,700.00 Bid Total: 187,570.00
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[]

Vol  Value

10-MR 16 325.000 5,200.00
10-OW 105 400.000 42,000.00
10-OR 216 400.000 86,400.00
18T-PR 30 24420 732.60
20T-MX 690 6.910 4,767.90
15T-OB 980 14.550 14,259.00
20T-00 2080 6.910 14,372.80
20T-A 90 8.820 793.80

Bid Total: 168,526.10

5/10/2022 3:23:28 PM

SCS-FMICOC-00083G
FSC 100%
187,570.00
176,685.00 [
173,180.00 [
168,526.10 []
139,620.70 [
136,700.00 [J -
Theodore Strzok Log. #1033  Inc [ ]| Country Forest Prod #1016 Inc[ ]
Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-MR 16 375.000 6,000.00 |[10-MR 16 250.000 4,000.00
10-OW 105 375.000 39,375.00 ||10-OW 105 565.000 59,325.00
10-OR 216 375.000 81,000.00 ||{10-OR 216 345.000 74,520.00
18T-PR 30 13.000 390.00 |[18T-PR 30 10.000 300.00
20T-MX 690 13.000 8,970.00 ||20T-MX 680 3.500 2,415.00
15T-OB 980 13.000 12,740.00 ||[15T-OB 980 26.000 25,480.00
20T-O0 2080 13.000 27,040.00 ||20T-O0 2080 3.000 6,240.00
20T-A 90 13.000 1,170.00 ||20T-A 90 10.000 900.00
| Bid_Total: 176,685.00 | Bid Total: 173,180.00_

Page 1 of 1




FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

5/10/2022 3:24:19 PM

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 ﬁggf%’gocmﬂm
715-743-5140 . ¥
Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 3-22 Minimum Bid:  19,878.80
Bridge Creek Logging #1049 33,832.00 v
Biewer WI Sawmill #1014 32,290.00 ]
Wiitala & Vozka Log #1038 31,568.00 LJ
Martin's Forestry LLC #1058 29,424.00 LI
Kron Forest Prod #1021 27,740.00 LJ
Walters Logging #1123 26,982.90 [
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 24,878.70 [
Ryder Logging #1061 23,560.00 [J
- B Byers Forestry #1120 22,943.00 L] B - )
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[_]| Martin's Forestry LLC #1058  Inc[_]|Biewer WI Sawmill #1014 Inc[_]||Byers Forestry #1120 Inc [_]||Kron Forest Prod #1021 Inc[ ]
Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
18T-PW 50 32.310  1,61550 |[18T-PW 50 40.000  2,000.00 |18T-PW 50 40.000  2,000.00 |[18T-PW 50 31100  1,555.00 |[18T-PW 50 30.000  1,500.00
18T-PR 680 32310 21,970.80 18T-PR 680 40.000 27,200.00 |18T-PR 680 44250 30,090.00 |18T-PR 680 31.100 21,148.00 |18T-PR 680 38.000 25:840.00
20T-MX 40 32310  1,292.40 20T-MX 40 5.600 22400 |20T-MX 40 5.000 200.00 | 20T-MX 40  6.000 240.00 [20T-MX 40 10.000 400.00
Bid Total: 24,878.70 Bid Total: 29,424.00 Bid Total: 32,290.00 Bid Total: 22,943.00 Bid Total: 27,740.00
| |
Bridge Creek Logging #1049  Inc []| Wiitala & Vozka Log #1038 Inc [] ||Ryder Logging #1061 Inc []||Walters Logging #1123 Inc[|
Vol  Value } Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol Value
18T-PW 50 45.000  2,250.00 |18T-PW 50 38.000  1,900.00 |18T-PW 50 32.000  1,600.00 |18T-PW 50 38570  1,928.50
18T-PR 680 46.150 31,382.00 |18T-PR 680 43.100 29,308.00 |18T-PR 680 32000 21,760.00 |18T-PR 680 36.600 24,888.00
20T-MX 40 5.000 200.00 iZDT-MX 40 9.000 360.00 |[20T-MX 40 5.000 200.00 ||20T-MX 40 4.160 166.40
Bid Total: 33,832.00 |i Bid Total; 31,568.00 Bid Total: 23,560.00 Bid Total: 26,082.90
L | - o

Page 1 of 1



FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456

715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

FSC 100%

SCS-FM/COC-00083G

Tract: 4-22 Minimum Bid: ~ 49,983.00

Northwest Hardwoods #1027 72,300.00

Byers Forestry #1120 61,770.50 [

Solberg Trucking LLC #1032 59,120.00 L

Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 58,857.40 [

Theodore Strzok Log. #1033 57,615.00 [

Ryder Logging #1061 54,209.00 []

] Country Forest Prod #1016 . 52,755.001 7
Ryder Logging #1061 Inc[ ] “Northwest Hardwoods #1027  Inc[ ]| Theodore Strzok Log. #1033  Inc[_]| Byers Forestry #1120 Inc [] ||Solberg Trucking LLC #1032  Inc[_]
Vol  Value ; Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-PW 2 120.000 240.00 | 10-PW 2 200.000 400.00 | 10-PW 2 120.000 240.00 ||10-PW 2 150.000 300.00 ||10-PW 2 125.000 250.00
10-MX 11 280.000  3,080.00 || 10-MX 11 350.000  3,850.00 | 10-MX 11 375.000  4,125.00 | 10-MX 11 385.000  4,235.00 |{10-MX 11 350.000  3,850.00
10-OW 6 425.000 2,550.00 |{10-OW 6 490.000 2,840.00 ||10-OW 6 375.000 2,250.00 |[10-OW 6 385.000 2,310.00 |{10-OW 6 350.000 2,100.00
10-OR 108 363.000 39,204.00 |10-OR 108 470.000 50,760.00 |10-OR 108 375.000 40,500.00 ||10-OR 108 385.000 41,580.00 |10-OR 108 350.000 37,800.00
20T-MX 160  5.500 880.00 |20T-MX 160 7.000  1,120.00 |[20T-MX 160 10.000  1,600.00 |[20T-MX 160 7.150  1,144.00  20T-MX 160 8.000  1,280.00
15T-OB 280 17.500 4,900.00 ||15T-OB 280 32.000 8,960.00 |{|[15T-OB 280 10.000 2,800.00 |[15T-OB 280 28.000 7,840.00 ||15T-OB 280 32.000 8,960.00
20T-00 610 5500  3,355.00 ||20T-00 610 7.000  4,270.00 ||20T-O0 610 10.000  6,100.00 |[20T-00 610 7.150  4,361.50 |20T-00 610 8.000  4,880.00
Bid Total: 54,209.00 Bid Total: 72,300.00 Bid Total: 57,615.00 Bid Total: - 61,7707.507| Bid Total: 59,120.00
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[_]|/Country Forest Prod #1016 Inc[]
Vol  Value Vol  Value

10-PW 2 140.000 280.00 ||10-PW 2 325.000 650.00
10-MX 11 325.000  3,575.00 ||10-MX 11 325.000  3,575.00
10-OW 6 400.000  2,400.00 ||10-OW 6 325.000  1,950.00
10-OR 108 400.000 43,200.00 |[10-OR 108 325.000 35,100.00
20T-MX 160 6920  1,107.20 ||20T-MX 160  4.000 640.00
15T-OB 280 14.550 4,074.00 ||15T-OB 280 30.000 8,400.00
‘20T-OO 610 6.920 4,221.20 ||20T-O0 610 4.000 2,440.00
‘ Bid Total: 58,857.40 Bid Total:  52,755.00 |

5/10/2022 3:24:44 PM
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 SOE TR0 B0
715-743-5140 00
Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 5.22 Minimum Bid:  42,506.20
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 51,379.50
Theodore Strzok Log. #1033 45,810.00 [J
Country Forest Prod #1016 38,480.00 [

Theodore Strzok Log. #1033 Inc [_]|/Country Forest Prod #1016 Inc [_]|Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[ |
Vol  Value

110-MR
110-0W
110-0R
|15T-HB
120T-MX
15T-OB
20T-00

10 250.000
22 325.000
70 325.000
60 9.000
180 9.000
350 9.000
900 9.000
Bid Total:

Vol  Value Vol  Value
2,500.00 |{10-MR 10 195.000 1,850.00 ||10-MR 10 325.000 3,250.00

7,150.00 ||10-OW 22 295.000 6,490.00 [|10-OW 22 400.000 8,800.00
22,750.00 |10-OR 70 295.000 20,650.00 |[10-OR 70 400.000 28,000.00
540.00 ||15T-HB 60 15.000 900.00 ||15T-HB 60 14.550 873.00
1,620.00 |20T-MX 180 3.000 540.00 (|20T-MX 180 2.300 414.00
3,150.00 ||16T-OB 350 15.000 5,250.00 [15T-OB 350 14.550 5,092.50
8,100.00 |20T-O0 900  3.000 2,700.00 ||20T-O0 900 5.500 4,950.00
45,810.00 Bid Total: 38,480.00 Bid Total: 51,379.50

5/10/2022 3:25:24 PM
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10-OW
10-OR
20T-MX
15T-OB
20T-00
15T-AB
20T-A
10-PW
10-MX

FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

FSC 100%

SCS-FM/COC-00083G

Lake States Timber #1056

Vol Value
6 170.000

21 325.000
300 3.000
140 15.000
340 3.000
180 13.000
500 11.000

1 120.000
5 130.000
Bid Total:

Inc[ ]

1,020.00
6,825.00
900.00
2,100.00
1,020.00
2,340.00
5,500.00
120.00
650.00
20,475.00 ||

Tract: 6-22 Minimum Bid:  19,705.40

Martin's Forestry LLC #1058 29,748.00

Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 24,035.20 LJ

Schreiner Forestry #1030 22,870.00 LI

Central WI Lumber #1810 21,679.60 L]

Lake States Timber #1056 - 20,475.00 [
Central WI Lumber #1810 Inc [_] ||Schreiner Forestry #1030 Inc [_]|[Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[_|

Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value

10-OW 6 450.000  2,700.00 ||10-OW 6 300.000  1,800.00 ||10-OW 6 400.000  2,400.00
10-OR 21 450.000 9,450.00 ||{10-OR 21 300.000 6,300.00 |[10-OR 21 400.000 8,400.00
20T-MX 300 4.180 1,254.00 |20T-MX 300 9.000 2,700.00 [|20T-MX 300 7.250 2,175.00
15T-0B 140 12.360 1,730.40 |[15T-OB 140 10.000 1,400.00 ||15T-OB 140 18.180 2,545.20
20T-00 340 4.180 1,421.20 ||20T-0O0 340 10.000 3,400.00 [|20T-O0 340 7.250 2,465.00
15T-AB 180 11.550  2,079.00 |[15T-AB 180 9.000  1,620.00 |[15T-AB 180 7.250  1,305.00
20T-A 500 3.340  1,670.00 |20T-A 500 9.000  4,500.00 ||[20T-A 500 7.250  3,625.00
10-PW 1 125.000 125.00 [10-PW 1 150.000 150.00 || 10-PW 1 120.000 120.00
10-MX 5 250.000  1,250.00 ||10-MX 5 200.000  1,000.00 ||10-MX 5 200.000  1,000.00
Bid Total: 21,679.60 B Bid Total} 22,870.00 Bid Total: 24,035.20

5/10/2022 3:25:49 PM

10-OW
10-OR

20T-MX

15T-OB

20T-00

15T-AB

20T-A

10-PW
10-MX

Vol Value
6 285.000

21 285.000
300 7.000
140 47.100
340  7.000
180 32.800
500 7.000

1 150.000
5 285.000
Bid Total:

[Martin's Forestry LLC #1058  Inc[_]

1,710.00
5,985.00
2,100.00
6,594.00
2,380.00
5,904.00
3,500.00
150.00
1,425.00
29,748.00
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 E(S:gfgﬁﬂfgoc-ooosae
715-743-5140 °
Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 7-22 Minimum Bid:  29,434.00
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 36,674.40
Martin's Forestry LLC #1058 35,900.00 LI
Schreiner Forestry #1030 34,390.00 [
Ryder Logging #1061 - - 33,655.00 L]
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 Inc[] Martin's Forestry LLC #1058 Inc [_]||Schreiner Forestry #1030 Inc [_]||Ryder Logging #1061 Inc[ ]
Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-MX 9 325.000 2,925.00 ||10-MX 9 285.000 2,565.00 ||10-MX 9 240.000 2,160.00 |[10-MX 9 280.000 2,520.00
10-OW 7 400.000  2,800.00 | 10-OW 7 285.000  1,995.00 ||10-OW 7 400.000  2,800.00 ||10-OW 7 425000  2,975.00
10-OR 58 400.000 23,200.00 | 10-OR 58 285.000 16,530.00 ||10-OR 58 350.000 20,300.00 [|10-OR 58 345.000 20,010.00
18T-PW 20 11.620 232.40 | 18T-PW 20 11.300 226.00 ||18T-PW 20 9.000 180.00 ||18T-PW 20 22.500 450.00
20T-MX 250 4.340  1,085.00 |20T-MX 250 6.000  1,500.00 ||20T-MX 250 9.000  2,250.00 ||20T-MX 250 5500  1,375.00
15T-OB 220 14.550  3,201.00 ||15T-OB 220 47.200 10,384.00 ||[15T-OB 220 10.000  2,200.00 |15T-OB 220 17.500  3,850.00
20T-00 450 7.180 3,231.00 | 20T-O0 450 6.000 2,700.00 ||20T-O0 450 10.000 4,500.00 ||20T-O0 450 5.500 2,475.00

Bid Total: 36,674.40 Bid Total:

135,900.00 B Total: ~34,390.00 ~ Bid Total: 33,655.00

5/10/2022 3:26:15 PM
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

Ryder Logging #1061

10-MR
10-00
15T-PW
20T-PW
20T-S
15T-HB
20T-MX
20T-00
15T-AB
20T-A

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 Egg-fggfgoc-oonase
715-743-5140 v
Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 8-22 Minimum Bid:  17,891.20
Ryder Logging #1061 18,875.00
Ule Logging #1064 18,568.00 [J
Inc[_]||Ule Logging #1064 Inc[]
Vol Value Vol  Value
4 300.000 1,200.00 ||10-MR 4 130.000 520.00
1 300.000 300.00 |10-00 1 120.000 120.00
90 17.500 1,575.00 ||[156T-PW 90 8.300 747.00 |
160 6.750 1,080.00 ||20T-PW 160 8.300 1,328.00 |
60 6.750 405.00 | 20T-S 60 8.300 498.00
60 17.500  1,050.00 15T-HB 60 8.300 498.00
500 6.750 3,375.00 ||20T-MX 500 8.300 4,150.00
210 6.750 1,417.50 I\‘ZOT—OO 210 8.300 1,743.00
110 17.500  1,925.00 ”15T-AB 110 8.300 913.00
970 6.750 6,547.50 ||20T-A 970 8.300 8,051.00
Bid Total:  18,875.00 | Bid Total:  18,568.00

5/10/2022 3:41:52 PM
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

Tract: 9.22 Minimum Bid:

Wiitala & Vozka Log #1038

Biewer WI Sawmill #1014

Kron Forest Prod #1021

Ryder Logging #1061
Biewer WI Sawmill #1014 Inc[_]||Kron Forest Prod #1021 Inc [ ]||Wiitala & Vozka Log #1038

Vol Value Vol  Value Vol Value
10-00 2 120.000 240.00 ||10-CO 2 120.000 240.00 (|10-00 2 150.000
18T-PR 920 39.790 36,606.80 ||{18T-PR 920 38.000 34,960.00 (|18T-PR 920 41.000
20T-00 70  2.000 140.00 ||20T-C0O 70 10.000 700.00 ||20T-C0O 70 8.000
20T-A 70 5.000 350.00 |[20T-A 70 10.000 700.00 ||20T-A 70 10.000
Bid Total: 37,336.80 Bid Total: 36,600.00 B Bid Total:

5/10/2022 3:42:06 PM

24,420.00
39,280.00
37,336.80 LI
36,600.00 L
30,810.00 O
Inc [_]||Ryder Logging #1061 Inc[ ]
Vol  Value
300.00 ||10-00 2 300.000 600.00
37,720.00 ||[18T-PR 920 32.000 29,440.00
560.00 ||20T-00 70 5.500 385.00
700.00 ||20T-A 70 5.500 385.00
39,280.00 Bid Total: 30,810.00

SCS-FM/COC-00083G
FSC 100%

Page 1 of 1



FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103
NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456

715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

FSC 100%

5/10/2022 3:42:27 PM

Tract: 10-22 Minimum Bid:  12,508.00
Ule Logging #1064 18,520.00
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 14,502.70 LJ
Walters Logging #1123 14,235.00 [J
Schreiner Forestry #1030 13,500.00 [
Yoder Logging #1357 12,855.00 [
) Ryder Logging #1061 12,855.00 [ )
Ryder Logging #1061 Inc[_]|\Walters Logging #1123 Inc [ ]| Ule Logging #1064 Inc []||Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[ ]
Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-MR 2 280.000 560.00 |[10-MR 2 400.000 800.00 ||10-MR 2 420.000 840.00 [10-MR 2 325.000 650.00
10-OW 5 345.000 1,725.00 ||10-OW 5 400.000 2,000.00 ||10-OW 5 420.000 2,100.00 |/ 10-OW 5 400.000 2,000.00
10-OR 20 345.000 6,900.00 ||{10-OR 20 400.000 8,000.00 ||10-OR 20 420.000 8,400.00 ||10-OR 20 400.000 8,000.00
18T-PR 50 22.500 1,125.00 ||18T-PR 50 20.000 1,000.00 ||18T-PR 50 18.000 900.00 |[18T-PR 50 13.000 650.00
20T-MX 70 5.500 385.00 ||20T-MX 70 4.160 291.20 ||20T-MX 70 18.000 1,260.00 ||20T-MX 70 7.060 494.20
15T-0OB 70 17.500 1,225.00 ||15T-OB 70 21.810 1,526.70 ||15T-OB 70 28.000 1,960.00 ||[15T-OB 70 14.650 1,025.50
20T-00 170 5.500 935.00 ||20T-00 170 3.630 617.10 [20T-O0 170 18.000 3,060.00 ||20T-O0 170 9.900 1,683.00
Bid Total: 12,855.00 Bid Total: 14,235.00 Bid Total: 18,520.00 Bid Total: 14,502.70
Schreiner Forestry #1030 Inc[] o
Vol  Value
10-MR 2 200.000 400.00
10-OW 5 400.000 2,000.00
10-OR 20 350.000 7,000.00
18T-PR 50 20.000 1,000.00
20T-MX 70 10.000 700.00
15T-OB 70 10.000 700.00
20T-00 170 10.000 1,700.00
Bid Total: 13,500.00

SCS-FM/ICOC-00083G

[Yoder Logging #1357
Vol  Value
10-MR 2 325.000
10-OW 5 325.000
10-OR 20 325.000
18T-PR 50 18.000
20T-MX 70  8.000
15T-OB 70 18.000
20T-00 170 8.000

Bid Total:

Inc[]

650.00
1,625.00
6,500.00

900.00

560.00
1,260.00
1,360.00

12,855.00

Page 1 of 1




FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

SCS-FMICOC-00083G

NElLstu}l;i,_;r:las_SCfigmN 54456 P

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 11-22 Minimum Bid:  71,244.40

Tigerton Lumber #1062 115,120.00
Northwest Hardwoods #1027 109,355.00 [
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 99,352.80 []
Theodore Strzok Log. #1033 86,580.00 LU
Country Forest Prod #1016 82,335.00 LU
Ryder Logging #1061 79,499.00 [
Schreiner Forestry #1030 78,800.00 [
Yoder Logging #1357 75,200.00 [

5/10/2022 3:42:48 PM Page 1 of 2



FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103
NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456

715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

FSC 100%

SCS-FMICOC-00083G

Inc[]

750.00
17,525.00 |
70,400.00
750.00
2,400.00
997.50
1,312.50
14,790.00
5,985.00

210.00

115,120.00

Tract: 11-22 Minimum Bid:  71,244.40

Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc [ |[Schreiner Forestry #1030 Iinc[_]|Theodore Strzok Log. #1033  Inc [_]||/Country Forest Prod #1016 Inc []|[Tigerton Lumber #1062

Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-MX 3 450.000 1,350.00 |10-MX 3 200.000 600.00 |[10-MX 3 375.000 1,125.00 |/10-MX 3 175.000 525.00 ||10-MX 3 250.000
10-OW 25 450.000 11,250.00 ||10-OW 25 400.000 10,000.00 ||10-OW 25 375.000 9,375.00 ||10-OW 25 375.000 9,375.00 [10-OW 25 701.000
10-OR 128 450.000 57,600.00 ||10-OR 128 350.000 44,800.00 ||10-OR 128 375.000 48,000.00 ||10-OR 128 375.000 48,000.00 ||10-OR 128 550.000
15T-PR 50 35.000 1,750.00 ||15T-PR 50 10.000 500.00 |[156T-PR 50 12.000 600.00 ||15T-PR 50 20.000 1,000.00 ||15T-PR 50 15.000
15T-PW 160 35.000 5,600.00 || 156T-PW 160 10.000 1,600.00 |[15T-PW 160 12.000 1,920.00 |[15T-PW 160 20.000 3,200.00 (|15T-PW 160 15.000
20T-PW 190 8.000 1,520.00 | 20T-PW 190 10.000 1,900.00 (|20T-PW 190 12.000 2,280.00 ||20T-PW 180 9.500 1,805.00 ||20T-PW 190 5.250
20T-MX 250 7.000 1,750.00 ||20T-MX 250 10.000 2,500.00 ||20T-MX 250 12.000 3,000.00 ||20T-MX 250 9.500 2,375.00 ||20T-MX 250 5.250
15T-OB 510 20.000 10,200.00 ||15T-OB 510 10.000 5,100.00 ||15T-OB 510 12.000 6,120.00 |[156T-OB 510 9.500 4,845.00 ||15T-OB 510 29.000
20T-00 1140 7.000 7,980.00 | 20T-OO0 1140 10.000 11,400.00 ||[20T-O0 1140 12.000 13,680.00 |[|20T-O0 1140 9.500 10,830.00 |[20T-OCO 1140 5.250
20T-A 40 8.820 352.80 | 20T-A 40 10.000 400.00 |[20T-A 40 12.000 480.00 ||20T-A 40  9.500 380.00 ||20T-A 40 5.250

Bid Total: 99,352.80 Bid Total: 78,800.00 Bid Total: 86,580.00 Bid Total: 82,335.00 Bid Total:

Yoder Logging #1357 Inc [_]|Northwest Hardwoods #1027  Inc[_]|Ryder Logging #1061 Inc ]

Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-MX 3 300.000 900.00 || 10-MX 3 455.000 1,365.00 ETO-MX 3 300.000 900.00
10-OW 25 300.000 7,500.00 ||10-OW 25 610.000 15,250.00 |/10-OW 25 425,000 10,625.00
10-OR 128 325.000 41,600.00 10-OR 128 455.000 58,240.00 |[10-OR 128 363.000 46,464.00
156T-PR 50 16.000 800.00 |15T-PR 50 35.000 1,750.00 ||15T-PR 50 17.500 875.00
15T-PW 160 16.000 2,660.00 | 15T-PW 160 35.000 5,600.00 ||[15T-PW 160 17.500 2,800.00
i20T-PW 190 12.000 2,280.00 ||20T-PW 190 7.000 1,330.00 |[20T-PW 190 5.500 1,045.00
|20T-MX 250 8.000 2,000.00 ||20T-MX 250 7.000 1,750.00 ||20T-MX 250 5.500 1,375.00
|15T-OB 510 16.000 8,160.00 |15T-OB 510 31.000 15,810.00 ||15T-OB 510 17.500 8,925.00
20T-00 1140 8.000 9,120.00 ||20T-O0 1140  7.000 7,980.00 ||20T-O0 1140 5.500 6,270.00
“ZDT—A 40  7.000 280.00 ||20T-A 40 7.000 280.00 ||20T-A 40 5.500 220.00
i Bid Total: 75,200.00 Bid Total: 109,355.00 Bid Total: 79,499.00

5/10/2022 3:42:49 PM
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103
NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456

715-743-5140 FSC 100%

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 12-22 Minimum Bid:  19,272.60
Weyer Logging LLC #1054 23,490.00

Ryder Logging #1061 21,745.00J
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 20,042.00 [J

Ryder Logging #1061
Vol  Value

10-OR 23 375.000
16T-PR 160 17.500
20T-PR 100 5.500
15T-HB 30 17.500
20T-MX 160 5.500
15T-OB 110 17.500
20T-O0 280 5.500

10-MX 5 300.000
10-0W 8 425.000
Bid Total:

5/10/2022 3:43:12 PM

Inc [_]|Weyer Logging LLC #1054 Inc [_]||Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[ ]

Vol  Value Vol  Value

8,625.00 ||[10-OR 23 370.000 8,510.00 ||10-OR 23 300.000 6,900.00

2,800.00 [|15T-PR 160 23.000 3,680.00 |[15T-PR 160 11.300 1,808.00
550.00 ||20T-PR 100  8.000 800.00 ||20T-PR 100 11.300 1,130.00
525.00 ||15T-HB 30 23.000 690.00 |[15T-HB 30 11.300 339.00
880.00 ||20T-MX 160 8.000 1,280.00 |20T-MX 160 11.300 1,808.00

1,925.00 ||[15T-OB 110 23.000 2,5630.00 |[15T-OB 110 11.300 1,243.00

1,540.00 ||20T-O0 280 8.000 2,240.00 ||20T-O0 280 11.300 3,164.00

1,500.00 | 10-MX 5160.000  800.00 ||10-MX 5 250.000  1,250.00
3,400.00 |10-OW 8 370.000  2,960.00 ||10-OW 8 300.000  2,400.00
21,745.00 Bid Total:  23,490.00 Bid Total:  20,042.00

SCS-FMICOC-00083G

Page 1 of 1



FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 Egg-%rgoc-ooom
715-743-5140 °
Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 13-22 Minimum Bid:  38,410.00
Wiitala & VVozka Log #1038 65,466.00
Biewer WI Sawmill #1014 62,316.00 LI
Kron Forest Prod #1021 56,320.00 L
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 54,190.00 L
Ryder Logging #1061 53,360.00 [
~ Martin's Forestry LLC #1058 40,265.0001 B
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc [_] ||Kron Forest Prod #1021 Inc [_]|[Biewer WI Sawmill #1014 Inc []|Martin's Forestry LLC #1058  Inc [ ]| Wiitala & Vozka Log #1038 Inc[]
Vol Value Vol Value Vol Value Vol Value Vol Value
10-00 3 150.000 450.00 ||10-00 3 120.000 360.00 ||10-00 3 120.000 360.00 ||10-00 3 275.000 825.00 ||10-00 3 150.000 450.00
18T-PR 1480 35500 52,540.00 ||18T-PR 1480 37.000 54,760.00 ||18T-PR 1480 41.700 61,716.00 |18T-PR 1480 26.000 38,480.00 |[18T-PR 1480 43.200 63,936.00
20T-00 120 10.000  1,200.00 |[20T-O00 120 10.000  1,200.00 [20T-O0 120  2.000 240.00 ||20T-00 120 8.000 960.00 ||20T-00 120 9.000  1,080.00
Bid Total: 54,190.00 Bid Total: 56,320.00 Bid Total: 62,316.00 Bid Total: 40,265.00 Bid Total: 65,466.00
IRyder Logging #1061 Inc[]
Vol  Value
10-00 3 300.000 900.00

|20T-00 120 5.500

18T-PR 1480 35.000 51,800.00

Bid Total: 53,360.00

660.00

5/10/2022 3:43:33 PM
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 14-22 Minimum Bid:  30,248.60

Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 50,300.00

SCS-FMICOC-00083G
FSC 100%

Theodore Strzok Log. #1033 44,397.50 L]

Krizan Trucking #1020 33,475.00 LI
Theodore Strzok Log. #1033 Inc [_]|[Krizan Trucking #1020 Inc [_]|Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[ ]

Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value

10-OW 8 390.000 3,120.00 ||10-OW 8 350.000 2,800.00 ||10-OW 8 450.000 3,600.00
10-OR 81 390.000 31,590.00 |[10-OR 81 350.000 28,350.00 ||10-OR 81 450.000 36,450.00
20T-MX 120 12500  1,500.00 ||20T-MX 120 3.000 360.00 |20T-MX 120 10.000  1,200.00
15T-OB 250 12.500 3,125.00 ([15T-OB 250 3.000 750.00 ||15T-OB 250 20.000 5,000.00
120T-00 405 12.500 5,062.50 ||20T-O0C 405 3.000 1,215.00 ||20T-O0 405 10.000 4,050.00
Bid Total: 44,397.50 Bid Total: 33,475.00 Bid Total  50,300.00

5/10/2022 3:44:05 PM
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

SCS-FM/COC-00083G
FSC 100%

5/10/2022 3:44:22 PM

Tract: 15-22 Minimum Bid:  30,620.40
Northwest Hardwoods #1027 48,780.00
Ule Logging #1064 47,840.00 [
Tigerton Lumber #1062 42,680.00 [
Solberg Trucking LLC #1032 40,680.00 LJ
Central WI Lumber #1810 39,436.50 L]
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 38,630.00 [
Country Forest Prod #1016 37,650.00 LI
Ryder Logging #1061 36,145.00 [
- Schreiner Forestry #1030 33,840.00 [J
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744  Inc[]!Northwest Hardwoods #1027  Inc [_]|/Solberg Trucking LLC #1032  Inc [_]|[Tigerton Lumber #1062 Inc []|[Schreiner Forestry #1030 Inc[_]
Vol Value Vol Value Vol Value Vol  Value Vol Value
10-MX 4 400.000 1,600.00 || 10-MX 4 460.000 1,840.00 |[10-MX 4 350.000 1,400.00 |[10-MX 4 250.000 1,000.00 ||10-MX 4 200.000 800.00
10-OW 10 400.000 4,000.00 ||10-OW 10 460.000 4,600.00 |[10-OW 10 350.000 3,500.00 |[10-OW 10 600.000 6,000.00 {[10-OW 10 400.000 4,000.00
10-OR 59 400.000 23,600.00 ||10-OR 59 460.000 27,140.00 |[10-OR 59 350.000 20,650.00 ||10-OR 59 450.000 26,550.00 ||10-OR 59 350.000 20,650.00
15T-PR 70 11.000 770.00 ||15T-PR 70 41.000 2,870.00 ||15T-PR 70 35.000 2,450.00 ([15T-PR 70 10.000 700.00 ||15T-PR 70 10.000 700.00
15T-PW 80 11.000 880.00 ||15T-PW 80 41.000 3,280.00 |[15T-PW 80 35.000 2,800.00 |[15T-PW 80 10.000 800.00 ||15T-PW 80 10.000 800.00
20T-PR 60 9.000 540.00 ‘ 20T-PR 60 7.000 420.00 [|20T-PR 60 10.000 600.00 [|20T-PR 60  5.000 300.00 ||20T-PR 60 9.000 540.00
20T-MX 150  8.000 1,200.00 ||20T-MX 150 7.000 1,050.00 ||20T-MX 150 8.000 1,200.00 ||20T-MX 150 5.000 750.00 ||20T-MX 150  9.000 1,350.00
15T-OB 170 20.000 3,400.00 ||15T-OB 170 31.000 5,270.00 [|[15T-OB 170 32.000 5,440.00 ||15T-OB 170 29.000 4,930.00 |15T-OB 170 10.000 1,700.00
20T-00 330 8.000 2,640.00 ' 20T-00 330 7.000 2,310.00 ||20T-O0 330 8.000 2,640.00 ||20T-O0 330 5.000 1,650.00 ||20T-00 330 10.000 3,300.00
Bid Total: 38,630.00 | Bid Total: 48,780.00 Bid Total: 40,680.00 Bid Total: 42,680.00 } Bid Total: 33,840.00
Central WI Lumber #1810 Inc [_]||Ule Logging #1064 Inc [_]||Country Forest Prod #1016 Inc [_]|[Ryder Logging #1061 Inc[]
Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol Value Vol  Value
10-MX 4 250.000 1,000.00 |[10-MX 4 420.000 1,680.00 |/10-MX 4 350.000 1,400.00 ||10-MX 4 300.000 1,200.00
10-OW 10 450.000 4,500.00 |[10-OW 10 420.000 4,200.00 |[10-OW 10 550.000 5,500.00 ||10-OW 10 425.000 4,250.00
10-OR 59 450.000 26,550.00 ||10-OR 59 420.000 24,780.00 (|10-OR 59 350.000 20,650.00 ||10-OR 59 375.000 22,125.00
15T-PR 70 16.660 1,166.20 ||15T-PR 70 18.000 1,260.00 [|15T-PR 70 20.000 1,400.00 |[15T-PR 70 17.500 1,225.00
15T-PW 80 16.660 1,332.80 ||[15T-PW 80 18.000 1,440.00 i1 5T-PW 80 20.000 1,600.00 |[15T-PW 80 17.500 1,400.00
20T-PR 60 2.250 135.00 ||20T-PR 60 18.000 1,080.00 | 20T-PR 60 10.000 600.00 | 20T-PR 60 5.500 330.00
20T-MX 150  4.450 667.50 ||20T-MX 150 18.000 2,700.00 [ 20T-MX 150 10.000 1,600.00 |20T-MX 150 5.500 825.00
15T-OB 170 13.450 2,286.50 |[156T-OB 170 28.000 4,760.00 |15T-OB 170 10.000 1,700.00 ||15T-OB 170 17.500 2,975.00
20T-O00 330 5.450 1,798.50 ||20T-O0 330 18.000 5,940.00 3.20T—OO 330 10.000 3,300.00 ||20T-O0 330 5.500 1,815.00
Bid thal: 39,43_6.5_(_] | Bid Total: 47,840.00 i‘ Bid Total: 37,650.00 Bid Total: 36,145.00
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

SCS-FM/COC-00083G
FSC 100%

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 16-22 Minimum Bid:  23,603.80

27,115.00
24,670.00 [

Ryder Logging #1061
Dairyland Forest Prod #1017

Ryder Logging #1061
Vol  Value
10-MX 16 280.000
10-OW 3 425.000
10-OR 26 375.000
15T-PW 250 17.500
20T-PW 170 5,500
15T-HB 50 17.500
20T-MX 350 5.500
15T-OB 90 17.500
20T-00 270 5.500
20T-A 80 5.500
Bid Total:

5/10/2022 3:44:45 PM

Inc [_]|[Dairyland Forest Prod #1017  Inc[ ]

Vol Value
4,480.00 ||10-MX 16 250.000 4,000.00
1,275.00 |[10-OW 3 300.000 900.00

9,750.00 [|10-OR 26 300.000 7,800.00
4,375.00 ||15T-PW 250 9.500 2,375.00
935.00 ||20T-PW 170 8.500 1,615.00
875.00 |[15T-HB 50  9.500 475.00
1,925.00 ||20T-MX 350 9.500 3,325.00
1,675.00 ||15T-OB 90 9.500 855.00
1,485.00 ||20T-O0 270 8.500 2,565.00
440.00 ||20T-A 80  9.500 760.00
27,115.00 Bid Total: 24,670.00
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report
5,064.80

Tract: 17-22 Minimum Bid:

Solberg Trucking LLC #1032
Tlusty Logging Inc #1034

Solberg Trucking LLC #1032  Inc [ || Tlusty Logging Inc #1034 Inc[ |
Vol  Value Vol  Value

18T-PR 400 18.000 7,200.00 ||18T-PR 400 15.230 6,092.00

20T-MX 10 10.000 100.00 |[20T-MX 10  8.000 80.00

Bid Total: 7,300.00 Bid Total: 6,172.00

5/10/2022 3:45:13 PM

SCS-FM/COC-00083G
FSC 100%

7,300.00
6,172.00 L1
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

"Ryder Logging #1061
Vol Value
10-00 10 300.000
15T-PW 200 17.500
20T-PW 170 8.750
20T-MX 350 8.750
15T-OB 80 17.500
20T-00 340 8.750
15T-AB 150 17.500
120T-A 510 8.750
Bid Total:

5/10/2022 3:45:30 PM

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 SCS-FM/COC-00083G
715-743-5140 FSC 100%
Bid Comparison Report
Tract. 18-22 Minimum Bid:  19,089.00

Ryder Logging #1061 22,687.50
Inc ]
3,000.00
3,600.00
1,487.50
3,062.50
1,675.00
2,975.00
2,625.00
4,462.50
22,687.50
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

Tract. 19-22

Northwest Hardwoods #1027

Tigerton Lumber #1062
Twin Forest Products #1036
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744
Central WI Lumber #1810
Theodore Strzok Log. #1033
Schreiner Forestry #1030
Country Forest Prod #1016

Minimum Bid: 102,700.90

FSC 100%

186,792.00

SCS-FMICOC-00083G

Tigerton Lumber #1062

180,970.50 []
177,560.00 [
145,400.00 [
136,697.30 L]
127,200.00 []
112,800.00 []
111,540.70 [
Inc[ ]
Vol  Value
100 5.250 525.00
2 150.000 300.00
53 701.000 37,153.00
215 560.000 120,400.00
40 5.250 210.00
560 29.000 16,240.00
1170 5.250 6,142.50
Bid Total: 180,970.50

5/10/2022 3:47:05 PM

Twin Forest Products #1036 Inc [_]|[Country Forest Prod #1016 Inc[_]|/Schreiner Forestry #1030 Inc[ ]
Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-PW 2 120.000 240.00 ; 10-PW 2 120.000 240.00 |[10-PW 2 150.000 300.00
10-OW 53 800.000 42,400.00 I‘ 10-OW 53 499.000 26,447.00 ||10-OW 53 350.000 18,550.00
10-OR 215 500.000 107,500.00 | /10-OR 215 300.000 64,500.00 ||10-OR 215 350.000 75,250.00
20T-MX 40 1.000 40.00 ||20T-MX 40 13.310 532.40 ||20T-MX 40 10.000 400.00
15T-OB 560 41.000 22,960.00 J 15T-OB 560 25580 14,324.80 ||[15T-OB 560 10.000 5,600.00
20T-00 1170  3.500 4,095.00 '20T-OO 1170  3.750 4,387.50 [20T-O0 1170 10.000 11,700.00
20T-A 100  3.250 325.00 ||20T-A 100 11.080 1,109.00 ||20T-A 100 10.000 1,000.00
Bid Total: 177,560.00 Bid Total: 111,540.70 Bid Total: 112,800.00
Theodore Strzok Log. #1033 Inc []||Northwest Hardwoods #1027  Inc[_]||Central WI Lumber #1810 Inc[ ]
Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
10-PW 2 120.000 240.00 ||10-PW 2 200.000 400.00 ||10-PW 2 125.000 250.00
10-OW 53 390.000 20,670.00 (|10-OW 53 779.000 41,287.00 |[10-OW 53 450.000 23,850.00
10-OR 215 390.000 83,850.00 |{10-OR 215 555.000 119,325.00 (|10-OR 215 450.000 96,750.00
20T-MX 40 12.000 480.00 ||20T-MX 40 6.000 240.00 ||20T-MX 40 6.730 269.20
15T-OB 560 12.000 6,720.00 ||156T-OB 560 32.000 17,920.00 |[15T-OB 560 13.450 7,532.00
20T-00 1170 12.000 14,040.00 ||20T-O0 1170 6.000 7,020.00 |{|20T-O0 1170 6.730 7,874.10
20T-A 100 12.000 1,200.00 ||20T-A 100 6.000 600.00 EZOT—A 100 1.720 172.00
Bid Total: 127,200.00 Bid Total: _ 186,792.00 Bid Total: 136,697.30

[Flannel Fleet Logging #1744

Inc[ ]
Vol  Value

2 250.000 500.00
53 450.000 23,850.00
215 450.000 96,750.00
40 10.000 400.00
560 20.000 11,200.00
1170 10.000 11,700.00
100 10.000 1,000.00

Bid Total: 145,400.00 J
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FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

Bid Comparison Report

FSC 100%

SCS-FM/COC-00083G

Tract: 20-22 Minimum Bid:  98,006.00
Stella-Jones Corporation #1860 212,046.61
Byers Forestry #1120 195,511.21 [
Bridge Creek Logging #1049 173,288.00 [
Biewer WI Sawmill #1014 166,894.20 []
Theodore Strzok Log. #1033 157,359.60 L
Kron Forest Prod #1021 153,690.00 [
~ Wiitala & Vozka Log #1038 151,756.00 [
Wiitala & Vozka Log #1038 Inc[_]||Kron Forest Prod #1021 Inc [ ] |/Stella-Jones Corporation #186 Inc[ || Theodore Strzok Log. #1033  Inc[ ] ||Byers Forestry #1120 Inc[ ]
Vol  Value Vol Value Vol  Value Vol  Value Vol  Value
18T-PW 30 38.000 1,140.00 ||18T-PW 30 15.000 450.00 ||18T-PW 30 13.000 390.00 |[18T-PW 30 48.760 1,462.80 |[18T-PW 30 60.720 1,821.60
18T-PR 3180 47.200 150,096.00 |[18T-PR 3180 48.000 152,640.00 ||[18T-PR 3180 66.370 211,056.61 ||[18T-PR 3180 48.760 155,056.80 ||18T-PR 3180 60.720 193,089.61
iZOT—MX 20 8.000 160.00 ||20T-MX 20 10.000 200.00 ||20T-MX 20 8.000 160.00 ||20T-MX 20 14.000 280.00 ||20T-MX 20 10.000 200.00
20T-00 40  9.000 360.00 ||20T-00 40 10.000 400.00 [20T-00 40 11.000 440.00 [|20T-00 40 14.000 560.00 ||20T-C0O 40 10.000 400.00
Bid Total:  151,756.00 Bid Total:  153,690.00 Bid Total:  212,046.61 Bid Total:  157,359.60 Bid Total:  195,511.21
|Bridge Creek Logging #1049  Inc[] |[Biewer WI Sawmill #1014 Inc[]
Vol  Value Vol  Value
18T-PW 30 25.000 750.00 |[18T-PW 30 25.000 750.00
18T-PR 3180 54.100 172,038.00 ||[18T-PR 3180 52.190 165,964.20
20T-MX 20 5.000 100.00 ||20T-MX 20 5.000 100.00
20T-00 40 10.000 400.00 ||20T-00 40 2.000 80.00
Bid Total: 173,288.00 Bid Total: 166,894.20
5/10/2022 3:47:55 PM Page 1 of 1




20T-MX
10-00
15T-PW
20T-PW
15T-OB
20T-00
15T-AB
20T-A

Vol  Value
360 8.000
5 120.000
390 8.000
170  8.000
20 8.000
140  8.000
80 8.000
2130 8.000

Bid Total:

FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

Flannel Fleet Loggin_g_#1744 - InE:D

2,880.00
600.00
3,120.00
1,360.00
160.00
1,120.00
640.00
17,040.00
26,920.00

5/10/2022 3:51:36 PM

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE
517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456 SCS-FMICOC-00083G
715-743-5140 FSC 100%
Bid Comparison Report
Tract. 21-22 Minimum Bid:  26,856.60
Flannel Fleet Logging #1744 26,920.00

Page 1 of 1



FORESTRY and PARKS DEPARTMENT

CLARK COUNTY COURTHOUSE

517 COURT STREET, ROOM 103

NEILLSVILLE, WISCONSIN 54456
715-743-5140

SCS-FM/COC-00083G
FSC 100%

Bid Comparison Report
Tract: 29-21 Minimum Bid:  15,087.20

Ryder Logging #1061 15,500.00

Ryder Logging #1061
Vol  Value
16T-PW 480 17.500
20T-PW 620 7.500
20T-T 80 7.500
20T-MX 110  7.500
15T-OB 20 17.500
20T-00 60 7.500
20T-A 30 7.500
Bid Total:

Inc[ ]

8,400.00
4,650.00
600.00
825.00
350.00
450.00
225.00
15,500.00

6/16/2022 1:36:33 PM
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